IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks

TABULATION SHEET

BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

The Davey Tree Expert
Company

Helping Hand Lawn Care,

Inc.

Zen Outdoors, LLC

, FL
Kent, OH Sorrento, FL Orlando, F
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
AIRPORT LAKES PARK, 7098 SHADOWRIDGE
Mowing, Blow, String
1 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 481.54 | $18,298.52 |$  500.00 | $ 19,000.00 500.00 | $ 19,000.00
Removal
2 38 Cycles I]::Zﬁfg‘pe Maintenance & $ 21498 |$ 8,169.24 [$  100.00 |'$ 3,800.00 200.00 | $  7,600.00
3 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 2,881.44 | $ 2,881.44 |$ 500.00 | $ 500.00 200.00 [$  200.00
4 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 5858 |$ 5858 ]|$ 100.00 | $ 100.00 200.00 | $  200.00
Trash & Debris Removal
5 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday |$  37.69 | $ 5,879.64 | $ 50.00 | $ 7,800.00 75.00 | $ 11,700.00
and Friday)
6 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 504.00 |$ 6,048.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 1,800.00 130.00 | $ 1,560.00

HEROES PARK, 14086 CENTERLINE DR,




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks

TABULATION SHEET

BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

The Davey Tree Expert
Company

Helping Hand Lawn Care,

Inc.

Zen Outdoors, LLC

, FL
Kent, OH Sorrento, FL Orlando, F
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, String
7 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 487.82 | $18,537.16 | $  600.00 | $ 22,800.00 800.00 | $ 30,400.00
Removal
8 38 Cycles EZZ?E;apeMamtenance& $ 193.19 |$ 734122 |$  150.00 |'$ 5,700.00 400.00 |'$ 15,200.00
9 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 4,052.16 | $ 4,052.16 |$ 500.00 | $ 500.00 400.00 | $  400.00
10 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 3372 |$ 3372 |$ 200.00 | $ 200.00 200.00 | $  200.00
Trash & Debris Removal
11 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday |$  37.69 | § 5,879.64 | § 75.00 | $ 11,700.00 150.00 | $ 23,400.00
and Friday)
12 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 504.00 | $ 6,048.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 2,400.00 260.00 | $ 3,120.00

LAKE FAIRVIEW PARK, 2200 LEE ROAD,




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks

TABULATION SHEET

BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

The Davey Tree Expert
Company

Helping Hand Lawn Care,

Inc.

Zen Outdoors, LLC

, FL
Kent, OH Sorrento, FL Orlando, F
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, String
13 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 537.67 |$20,43146 |$ 600.00 | $22,800.00 600.00 | $ 22,800.00
Removal
14 38 Cycles EZZ?E;apeMamtenance& $ 18256 |$ 6,937.28 [$  100.00 |'$ 3,800.00 150.00 | $ 5,700.00
15 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 3,916.08 | $ 3,916.08 | $ 300.00 |$ 300.00 200.00 | $  200.00
16 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 3,916.08 | $ 3,916.08 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 100.00 | $ 100.00
Trash & Debris Removal
17 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday |$  37.69 | § 5,879.64 | § 75.00 | $ 11,700.00 125.00 | $ 19,500.00
and Friday)
18 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 504.00 | $ 6,048.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 1,800.00 162.50 | $ 1,950.00

MCCOY PARK, DOWDEN ROAD, ORLANDO FL




TABULATION SHEET

IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

The Davey Tree Expert
Company

Helping Hand Lawn Care,
Inc.

Zen Outdoors, LLC

, FL
Kent, OH Sorrento, FL Orlando, F
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, String
19 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 604.58 | $22,974.04 | $  400.00 | $ 15,200.00 500.00 | $ 19,000.00
Removal
20 38 Cycles EZZ?E?"G Maintenance & $ 21678 |$ 8,237.64 [$ 7500 |'$ 2,850.00 200.00 | $  7,600.00
21 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 4,863.60 | $ 4,863.60 |$ 200.00 |$ 200.00 200.00 | $  200.00
22 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer Included $ - |$ 100.00 |$ 100.00 150.00 | $ 150.00
Trash & Debris Removal
23 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday |$  37.69 | $ 5,879.64 | $ 50.00 | $ 7,800.00 75.00 | $ 11,700.00
and Friday)
24 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 504.00 | $ 6,048.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 1,800.00 162.50 | $ 1,950.00

ROSEMONT COMMUNITY CENTER, 4880 ROSE

BAY DRIVE, ORLANDO FL 32808




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks

TABULATION SHEET

BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

The Davey Tree Expert
Company

Helping Hand Lawn Care,

Inc.

Zen Outdoors, LLC

, FL
Kent, OH Sorrento, FL Orlando, F
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, String
25 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 34453 | $13,092.14 | $  500.00 | $ 19,000.00 400.00 | $ 15,200.00
Removal
26 38 Cycles EZZ?E;apeMamtenance& $ 198.83 |$ 7,555.54 [$  100.00 |'$ 3,800.00 200.00 | $  7,600.00
27 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 1,950.48 | $ 1,950.48 |$ 300.00 | $ 300.00 300.00 | $  300.00
28 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 16.00 | $ 16.00 [$ 100.00 |$ 100.00 100.00 | $ 100.00
Trash & Debris Removal
29 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday |$  37.69 | $ 5,879.64 | $ 75.00 | $ 11,700.00 85.00 | $ 13,260.00
and Friday)
30 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 504.00 | $ 6,048.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 1,800.00 195.00 | $§ 2,340.00

SOUTHPORT COMMUNITY PARK, 3437
BARNSTABLE PLACE, ORLANDO, FL 32827




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks

TABULATION SHEET

BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

The Davey Tree Expert
Company

Helping Hand Lawn Care,

Inc.

Zen Outdoors, LLC

, FL
Kent, OH Sorrento, FL Orlando, F
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, String
31 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 1,045.89 | $39,743.82 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 57,000.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 41,800.00
Removal
32 38 Cycles EZZ?E;apeMamtenance& $  412.05 | $15,657.90 [$  250.00 |'$ 9,500.00 |$  300.00 | $ 11,400.00
33 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 6,68520 |$ 6,68520|$ 400.00 |$ 400.00 |[$ 300.00|$  300.00
34 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 64830 |$ 64830 |$ 100.00 |$ 100.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 150.00
Trash & Debris Removal
35 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday |$  37.69 | $ 5,879.64 |$ 150.00 | $23,400.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 24,960.00
and Friday)
36 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 504.00 |$ 6,048.00 |$ 300.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 162.50 | $ 1,950.00

TROTTERS PARK, 1905 LEE RD, ORLANDO, FL




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks

TABULATION SHEET

BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

The Davey Tree Expert
Company

Helping Hand Lawn Care,

Inc.

Zen Outdoors, LLC

, FL
Kent, OH Sorrento, FL Orlando, F
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, String
37 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 1,135.74 | $43,158.12 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 64,600.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 49,400.00
Removal
38 38 Cycles I]::Zﬁfg‘pe Maintenance & $ 44288 | $16,829.44 |$  400.00 | $15,200.00 |$  500.00 | $ 19,000.00
39 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 9,43831 | $ 9,438.31 |$ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $  440.00 | $  440.00
40 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer Included $ - |$ 50000 )$ 500.00$ 200.00]$ 200.00
Trash & Debris Removal
41 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday |$  38.04 | $ 5,934.24 |$  200.00 | $31,200.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 19,500.00
and Friday)
42 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 504.00 | $ 6,048.00 |$ 400.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 162.50 | $ 1,950.00

HOURLY RATE TO PERFORM REPAIRS, IRRIGATION
SERVICES OR GENERAL SERVICES

Straight Time Hourly Rate Monday through Friday 7:00 a. m. to




TABULATION SHEET

IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

The Davey Tree Expert
Company

Helping Hand Lawn Care,
Inc.

Zen Outdoors, LLC

Kent, OH Sorrento, FL Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
43 25 Per Hour |Foreman $§ 70.00]$% 1,750.00 | $ 50.001$ 1,250.00 | $ 45.001$ 1,125.00
44 25 Per Hour |Helper $ 60.00]$% 1,500.00 | $ 30.001$ 750.00 | $ 32.00]$ 800.00
HOURLY RATE TO PERFORM REPAIRS, IRRIGATION
SERVICES OR GENERAL SERVICES
Overtime Hourly Rate
45 25 Per Hour |Foreman $ 105.00]9% 2,625.00 | $ 75.00]1$ 1,875.00 | $ 67.501$ 1,687.50
46 25 Per Hour |Helper $ 90.001% 2,250.00 | $ 45.001$ 1,125.00 | $ 48.001$ 1,200.00
Parts/Materials furnished by the
47 N/A N/a  |Proposer shall beat Proposer’s f 0, Mark-Up | NoBid | Mark-Up 20% Mark-Up
actual cost plus (%).
Evidence of actual cost shall be
GRAND TOTAL | S 377,096.55 | S 398,750.00 | S 418,492.50




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

TABULATION SHEET

Groundtek of Central

Around2it Landscape

J&N lawn ReEnforcement

Florida LLC Services Inc Pest Control
Ocoee, FL Apopka, FL Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
AIRPORT LAKES PARK, 7098 SHADOWRIDGE
Mowing, Blow, String
1 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 300.00 | $11,400.00 | $ 450.00 | $17,100.00 840.00 31,920.00
Removal
2 38 Cycles EZZ?E?"G Maintenance & $  100.00 |'$ 3,800.00 |'$ 300.00 | $11,400.00 840.00 | $ 31,920.00
3 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 110.00 |$ 110.00 |$ 300.00|$ 300.001$ 1,500.00 1,500.00
4 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 55.00 | $ 55.00 |$ 185.00]$ 185.00]$ 400.00 400.00
Trash & Debris Removal
5 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday | $ 30.00 | $§ 4,680.00 |$  30.00 |$ 4,680.00 | $ 105.00 16,380.00
and Friday)
6 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 3500 |$ 420.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 480.00]S$ 2,000.00 24,000.00

HEROES PARK, 14086 CENTERLINE DR,




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

TABULATION SHEET

Groundtek of Central

Around2it Landscape

J&N lawn ReEnforcement

Florida LLC Services Inc Pest Control
Ocoee, FL Apopka, FL Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, Strine
7 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 265.001%10,070.00 | $ 800.00 | $30,400.00 | $ 1,120.00 42,560.00
Removal
8 38 Cycles I]::Zﬁfg‘pe Maintenance & $  50.00|$ 1,900.00 |$ 350.00|$13,300.00|$  420.00]$ 15,960.00
9 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 110.00 |$ 110.00 [$ 300.00|$ 300.00 |$ 994.00 994.00
10 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 55.00 | $ 55.00 |$ 15000 % 150.00]|$ 600.00 600.00
Trash & Debris Removal
11 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday | $ 30.00 | $ 4,680.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 4,680.00 | $ 315.00 49,140.00
and Friday)
12 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 3500 |$ 420.00 |$ 38.00|$ 456.00|$ 1,000.00 12,000.00

LAKE FAIRVIEW PARK, 2200 LEE ROAD,




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

TABULATION SHEET

Groundtek of Central

Around2it Landscape

J&N lawn ReEnforcement

Florida LLC Services Inc Pest Control
Ocoee, FL Apopka, FL Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, Strine
13 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 300.00 | $11,400.00 | $ 600.00 | $22,800.00 | $ 1,120.00 42,560.00
Removal
14 38 Cycles EZZ?E?"G Maintenance & $  100.00 |$ 3,800.00 |$ 300.00 | $11,400.00 |$  420.00]$ 15,960.00
15 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 110.00 |$ 110.00 |$ 28500]$% 285.00]S% 2,000.00 2,000.00
16 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 55.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 150.00$ 150.00]$ 1,300.00 1,300.00
Trash & Debris Removal
17 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday | $ 30.00 | $ 4,680.00 |$  30.00 | $ 4,680.00 | $ 460.00 71,760.00
and Friday)
18 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 3500 |$  420.00 |$ 39.00|$ 468.00|S$ 2,000.00 24,000.00

MCCOY PARK, DOWDEN ROAD, ORLANDO FL




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

TABULATION SHEET

Groundtek of Central

Around2it Landscape

J&N lawn ReEnforcement

Florida LLC Services Inc Pest Control
Ocoee, FL Apopka, FL Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowing Blow String
19 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 265.00 |$10,070.00 | $ 485.00 | $18,430.00 1$ 1,120.00 42,560.00
Removal
20 38 Cycles EZZ?E?"G Maintenance & $  50.00|$ 1,900.00|s 250.00]|$ 9500008  820.00]$ 31,160.00
21 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 110.00 |$ 110.00 |$ 200.00|$ 200.001$ 2,000.00 2,000.00
22 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 55.00 | $ 55.00 |$ 100.00|$ 100.00|$ 860.00 860.00
Trash & Debris Removal
23 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday | $ 30.00 | $ 4,680.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 4,680.00 | $ 560.00 87,360.00
and Friday)
24 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 35.00 |$ 420.00 | $ 55.001$ 660.00|$ 1,100.00 13,200.00

ROSEMONT COMMUNITY CENTER, 4880 ROSE
BAY DRIVE, ORLANDO FL 32808




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

TABULATION SHEET

Groundtek of Central

Around2it Landscape

J&N lawn ReEnforcement

Florida LLC Services Inc Pest Control
Ocoee, FL Apopka, FL Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, Strine
25 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 300.00 | $11,400.00 | $ 485.00|$18,430.00 |$ 1,140.00 43,320.00
Removal
26 38 Cycles EZZ?E?"G Maintenance & $ 100.00 |$ 3,800.00 |$ 250.00|$ 9,500.00 |$  700.00]$ 26,600.00
27 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 110.00 |$ 110.00 [$ 200.00|$ 200.00 | $ 675.00 675.00
28 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 55.00 | $ 55.00 |$ 100.00|$ 100.00|$ 515.00 515.00
Trash & Debris Removal
29 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday | $ 30.00 | $ 4,680.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 4,680.00 | $ 280.00 43,680.00
and Friday)
30 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 35.00 |$ 420.00 | $ 3400 |$ 408.00 ]S 900.00 10,800.00

SOUTHPORT COMMUNITY PARK, 3437
BARNSTABLE PLACE, ORLANDO, FL 32827




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks

TABULATION SHEET

BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

Groundtek of Central

Around2it Landscape

J&N lawn ReEnforcement

Florida LLC Services Inc Pest Control
Ocoee, FL Apopka, FL Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, Strine
31 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $  650.00 | $24,700.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 1,120.00 42,560.00
Removal
32 38 Cycles EZZ?E?"G Maintenance & $  150.00 |$ 5,700.00 |NoBid |NoBid |$  630.00]$ 23,940.00
33 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 1,850.00 1,850.00
34 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 22500 |$ 225.00 | NoBid No Bid $ 850.00 850.00
Trash & Debris Removal
35 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday | $ 30.00 | $ 4,680.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 210.00 32,760.00
and Friday)
36 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 35.00 | $ 420.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 1,120.00 13,440.00

TROTTERS PARK, 1905 LEE RD, ORLANDO, FL




IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks

TABULATION SHEET

BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

Groundtek of Central

Around2it Landscape

J&N lawn ReEnforcement

Florida LLC Services Inc Pest Control
Ocoee, FL Apopka, FL Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
Mowine, Blow, String
37 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 650.00 | $24,700.00 | $ 685.00 | $26,030.00 1,400.00 53,200.00
Removal
38 38 Cycles I]::Zﬁfg‘pe Maintenance & $  150.00 |'$ 5,700.00 |'$  300.00 | $11,400.00 840.00 | $ 31,920.00
39 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 40000 ]$ 40000]$ 28500]% 285.00 2,300.00 2,300.00
40 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 22500|$ 22500]|$ 150.00|S$ 150.00 1,400.00 1,400.00
Trash & Debris Removal
41 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday | $ 30.00 | § 4,680.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 4,680.00 210.00 32,760.00
and Friday)
42 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 3500 |$ 42000 |$ 132.00|$ 1,584.00 2,300.00 27,600.00

HOURLY RATE TO PERFORM REPAIRS, IRRIGATION
SERVICES OR GENERAL SERVICES

Straight Time Hourly Rate Monday through Friday 7:00 a. m. to




TABULATION SHEET

IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks

BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

Groundtek of Central

Around2it Landscape

J&N lawn ReEnforcement

Florida LLC Services Inc Pest Control
Ocoee, FL Apopka, FL Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price Price Price
Per Year
43 25 Per Hour |Foreman $ 45.0018$ 1,125.001] $ 15.000$ 375001 $ 30.001 $ 750.00
44 25 Per Hour |Helper $ 350018 875.00| $ 12.00]$ 300001 $ 18.00] $ 450.00

HOURLY RATE TO PERFORM REPAIRS, IRRIGATION
SERVICES OR GENERAL SERVICES

Overtime Hourly Rate

45 25 Per Hour |Foreman $ 45.001% 1,125.00 | $ 37.501% 93750 $ 30.00] $ 750.00
46 25 Per Hour |Helper $ 35000 87500 | $ 20.00]$ 500.00|$ 18.00] $ 450.00
Parts/Materials furnished by the
47 N/A Ny/a  [Proposer shall be at Proposer’s 20% Mark-Up 20% | Mark-Up | NoBid Mark-Up
actual cost plus (%).
Evidence of actual cost shall be
GRAND TOTAL | S 172,115.00 | S 236,343.50 | S 954,664.00




TABULATION SHEET
IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

P & L Lawn Maintenance

Inc
Orlando, FL

Estimated

Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price
Per Year

AIRPORT LAKES PARK, 7098 SHADOWRIDGE

Mowing, Blow, String
1 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 350.00 | $ 13,300.00

Removal

Landscape Maintenance &

2 38 Cycles Edging $ 205.00 |8 7,790.00

3 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 900.00 |$ 900.00

4 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 450.00 |$ 450.00
Trash & Debris Removal

5 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday | $ 75.00 | $ 11,700.00
and Friday)

6 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 100.00 | $ 1,200.00

HEROES PARK, 14086 CENTERLINE DR,




TABULATION SHEET
IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

P & L Lawn Maintenance
Inc
Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, Strine
7 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 450.00 | $17,100.00
Removal
8 38 Cycles |LAndscape Maintenance & $  102.00 |'$ 3.,876.00
Edging
9 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 750.00 |$ 750.00
10 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 250.00 |$ 250.00
Trash & Debris Removal
11 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday | $ 75.00 | $ 11,700.00
and Friday)
12 12 Month |lrrigation System Inspection $ 100.00 | $ 1,200.00
LAKE FAIRVIEW PARK, 2200 LEE ROAD,




TABULATION SHEET
IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

P & L Lawn Maintenance
Inc
Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, Strine
13 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 400.00 | $ 15,200.00
Removal
14 38 Cycles |F@ndscape Maintenance & $  205.00|$ 7,790.00
Edging
15 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 500.00 |$ 500.00
16 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 300.00 |[$ 300.00
Trash & Debris Removal
17 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday | $ 50.00 | $ 7,800.00
and Friday)
18 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 150.00 | $ 1,800.00
MCCOY PARK, DOWDEN ROAD, ORLANDO FL




TABULATION SHEET
IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

P & L Lawn Maintenance
Inc
Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, Strine
19 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 300.00 | $11,400.00
Removal
20 38 Cycles |LAndscape Maintenance & $  153.00 |'$ 5,814.00
Edging
21 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 400.00 | $ 400.00
22 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 200.00 |$ 200.00
Trash & Debris Removal
23 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday | $ 75.00 | $ 11,700.00
and Friday)
24 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 125.00 |$ 1,500.00
ROSEMONT COMMUNITY CENTER, 4880 ROSE
BAY DRIVE, ORLANDO FL 32808




TABULATION SHEET
IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

P & L Lawn Maintenance
Inc
Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, Strine
25 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 450.00 | $17,100.00
Removal
26 38 Cycles |F@ndscape Maintenance & $  270.00 | $10,260.00
Edging
27 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 400.00 | $ 400.00
28 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 200.00 |$ 200.00
Trash & Debris Removal
29 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday |$  100.00 | $ 15,600.00
and Friday)
30 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 100.00 | $ 1,200.00
SOUTHPORT COMMUNITY PARK, 3437
BARNSTABLE PLACE, ORLANDO, FL 32827




TABULATION SHEET
IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

P & L Lawn Maintenance
Inc
Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price
Per Year
Mowing, Blow, Strine
31 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 1,000.00 | $ 38,000.00
Removal
32 38 Cycles |LAndscape Maintenance & $  410.00 | $15,580.00
Edging
33 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 900.00 |$ 900.00
34 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 600.00 |[$ 600.00
Trash & Debris Removal
35 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday |$  100.00 | $ 15,600.00
and Friday)
36 12 Month |Irrigation System Inspection $ 300.00 | $ 3,600.00
TROTTERS PARK, 1905 LEE RD, ORLANDO, FL




TABULATION SHEET
IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

P & L Lawn Maintenance
Inc
Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price
Per Year
Mowing Blow String
37 38 Cycles |Trimming, Litter & Debris $ 1,200.00 | $45,600.00
Removal
38 38 Cycles |LAndscape Maintenance & $  410.00 | $15,580.00
Edging
39 1 Cycles |Turf Fertilizer $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00
40 1 Cycles |Shrub Fertilizer $ 750.00 |$ 750.00
Trash & Debris Removal
41 156 Days |(Every Monday, Wednesday |$  100.00 | $ 15,600.00
and Friday)
42 12 Month |lrrigation System Inspection $ 400.00 | $ 4,800.00
HOURLY RATE TO PERFORM REPAIRS, IRRIGATION
SERVICES OR GENERAL SERVICES
Straight Time Hourly Rate Monday through Friday 7:00 a. m. to




TABULATION SHEET
IFB20-0050 - Grounds Maintenance for Recreation Division Parks
BID OPENING - MAY 21, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

P & L Lawn Maintenance
Inc
Orlando, FL
Estimated
Item No. Cycles or Unit Description Unit Price Exte.n ded
Amounts Price
Per Year
43 25 Per Hour |Foreman $ 55.001% 1,375.00
44 25 Per Hour |Helper $ 45.001$ 1,125.00
HOURLY RATE TO PERFORM REPAIRS, IRRIGATION
SERVICES OR GENERAL SERVICES
Overtime Hourly Rate
45 25 Per Hour |Foreman $ 55.001% 1,375.00
46 25 Per Hour |Helper $ 45.001$ 1,125.00
Parts/Materials furnished by the
Proposer shall be at Proposer’s
47 N/A N/A 10% Mark-Up
actual cost plus (%).
Evidence of actual cost shall be
GRAND TOTAL | S 342,190.00
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