
Purchasing Agent:

Angela Thomas

CITY OF ORLANDO

PROCUREMENT CONTRACTS - BID TAB

IFB18-0289

HYDROLOGIC MONITORING STATIONS.

WED. JULY 11, 2018, 2:00 P

Staff Assistant:

J. Rosario

Description Unit

Estimated 

Cycles or 

Amounts 

Per Year

Item 

No. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

NEMA Enclosure (No Substitution): Campbell Scientific 16" x 18" (with backplate. No pre-drilled 

holes.) 65 EACH
1

-$                -$                 400.52$          26,033.80$       -$                -$                 487.50$          31,687.50$       -$                -$                 

Pressure Transducer (No Substitution):  Campbell Scientific CS451-L Pressure Transducer - 

various lengths 65 EACH
2

-$                -$                 847.50$          55,087.50$       -$                -$                 804.75$          52,308.75$       -$                -$                 

Data Logger (No Substitution): Campbell Scientific CR310 Data Logger 65 EACH 3 -$                -$                 898.60$          58,409.00$       -$                -$                 876.25$          56,956.25$       -$                -$                 

NO BID 139,530.30$     NO BID 140,952.50$     NO BID

Radio (No Substitution):  Sierra Wireless Raven RV50 65 EACH 4 -$                -$                 483.42$          31,422.30$       -$                -$                 643.75$          41,843.75$       -$                -$                 

Radio Mounting Bracket (No Substitution): AirLink Raven RV50 Mounting Bracket 65 EACH 5 -$                -$                 24.07$            1,564.55$         -$                -$                 27.50$            1,787.50$         -$                -$                 

NO BID 32,986.85$       NO BID 43,631.25$       NO BID

Antenna: Low Profile MiMo Cellular Antenna SMA; compatible with modem/radio; through 

mounted                                                                                                                                                                          

Item Make and Model bidding: ________________________________________________ 65 EACH

6

-$                 37.37$            2,429.05$         -$                -$                 36.89$            2,397.85$         -$                -$                 

Solar Panel:  30 Watt Solar Panel with enclosing frame for mounting to bracket                                                                                                          

Item Make and Model bidding: ________________________________________________ 65 EACH
7

-$                -$                 210.65$          13,692.25$       -$                -$                 174.63$          11,350.95$       -$                -$                 

Solar Panel Mounting Bracket:  Compatible with solar panel                                                                                       

Item Make and Model bidding: ________________________________________________ 65 EACH
8

-$                -$                 44.17$            2,871.05$         -$                -$                 48.75$            3,168.75$         -$                -$                 

Solar Voltage Regulator:  Morningstar Corp SS-6-12V, or equivalent                                                                                         

Item Make and Model bidding: ________________________________________________ 65 EACH
9

-$                -$                 47.57$            3,092.05$         -$                -$                 50.00$            3,250.00$         -$                -$                 

Ion Dissipator: Landfall Navigation/Forespar Lightning Master Diffuser SFLM1, or equivalent                                                                                                                                    

Item Make and Model bidding: ________________________________________________                                              
65 EACH

10

-$                -$                 158.55$          10,305.75$       -$                -$                 134.50$          8,742.50$         -$                -$                 

Surge Protector:  Coaxial SMA surge protector, SMA Female to SMA Female                                                                                                                             

Item Make and Model bidding: ________________________________________________ 130 EACH
11

-$                -$                 133.64$          17,373.20$       -$                -$                 25.00$            3,250.00$         -$                -$                 

Ground Rod:  5/8 in x 8ft Copper-plated Steel Ground Rod                                                                             

Item Make and Model bidding: ________________________________________________ 52 EACH
12

-$                -$                 16.95$            881.40$            -$                -$                 18.75$            975.00$            -$                -$                 

12V 35aH Sealed Battery, AGM preferred                                                                                                                 

Item Make and Model bidding: ________________________________________________ 70 EACH
13

-$                -$                 113.19$          7,923.30$         -$                -$                 100.00$          7,000.00$         -$                -$                 

RF/Cable - SMA-Male To SMA-Female - 3' Length                                                                                                   

Item Make and Model bidding: ________________________________________________ 130 EACH
14

-$                -$                 16.99$            2,208.70$         -$                -$                 41.25$            5,362.50$         -$                -$                 
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ANALYTICAL & 

DIAGNOSTIC SERVICES, 

LLC

LOCHER 

ENVIRONMENTAL 

TECHNOLOGY

Winter Haven, FL Venice, FL 

HYDROGAGE, INC. YSI, INC.

DNK ENVIRONMENTAL, 

INC. 

Vendor's City & State: Valrico, FL St. Petersburg, FL Lithia, FL 

SECTION 1Verizon Wireless SIM Card:  VZW SIM Card                                                                                                 

Item Make and Model bidding: ________________________________________________ 65 EACH
15

-$                -$                 -$                -$                 -$                -$                 6.25$              406.25$            -$                -$                 

NO BID 60,776.75$       NO BID 45,903.80$       NO BID

Rain Gauge (No Substitution):  Texas Electronics TR-525USW (Must specify 0.01 inch/tip) 18 EACH 16 -$                -$                 434.74$          7,825.32$         -$                -$                 481.25$          8,662.50$         -$                -$                 

Rain Gauge Mounting Base (No Substitution):  Texas Electronics MB-525 18 EACH 17 -$                -$                 148.75$          2,677.50$         -$                -$                 165.00$          2,970.00$         -$                -$                 

Bird Spikes (No Substitution): Texas Electronics Bird-B-Gone Strips BB-525 24"  (2 per station)
72 EACH

18
-$                -$                 37.75$            2,718.00$         -$                -$                 46.25$            3,330.00$         -$                -$                 

Texas Electronics Field Calibration Kit  FC-500  (No substitutions)  1 KIT 19 -$                -$                 396.38$          396.38$            -$                -$                 437.50$          437.50$            -$                -$                 

Texas Electronics Rain Gauge LCD Counter  BC-200  (optional) 1 EACH 20 -$                -$                 141.56$          141.56$            -$                -$                 156.25$          156.25$            -$                -$                 

NO BID 13,758.76$       NO BID 15,556.25$       NO BID

Stage Accessory List (Horizontal) - Refer to Exhibit A 40 LOTS 21 -$                -$                 2,475.00$       99,000.00$       942.98$          37,719.20$       1,125.00$       45,000.00$       -$                -$                 

Stage Accessory List (Vertical-Horizontal)  - Refer to Exhibit B 5 LOTS 22 -$                -$                 2,475.00$       12,375.00$       1,037.28$       5,186.40$         1,187.50$       5,937.50$         -$                -$                 

Stage Accessory List (Vertical) - Refer to Exhibit C 2 LOTS 23 -$                -$                 2,475.00$       4,950.00$         933.55$          1,867.10$         1,187.50$       2,375.00$         -$                -$                 

Stage + Rain Gauge Accessory List (Horizontal) - Refer to Exhibit D 16 LOTS 24 -$                -$                 1,925.00$       30,800.00$       1,192.98$       19,087.68$       1,375.00$       22,000.00$       -$                -$                 

Stage + Rain Gauge Accessory List (Vertical-Horizontal)  - Refer to Exhibit E 0 LOTS 25 -$                -$                 1,925.00$       -$                 1,287.28$       -$                   1,600.00$       -$                   -$                -$                 

Stage + Rain Gauge Accessory List (Vertical) - Refer to Exhibit F 2 LOTS 26 -$                -$                 1,925.00$       3,850.00$         1,183.55$       2,367.10$         1,500.00$       3,000.00$         -$                -$                 

NO BID 150,975.00$     66,227.48$       78,312.50$       NO BID

 

Removal and disposal of existing stations 67 EACH 27 -$                -$                 562.50$          37,687.50$       822.25$          55,090.75$       425.00$          28,475.00$       -$                -$                 

Installation of Stage site (Horizontal) - Refer to Diagram B, E and F; Section II,  pp. 15-20 40 EACH 28 -$                -$                 706.25$          28,250.00$       1,138.50$       45,540.00$       550.00$          22,000.00$       -$                -$                 

Installation of Stage site (Vertical-Horizontal) - Refer to Diagram B, C and E; Section II, pp 15-20 5 EACH 29 -$                -$                 812.50$          4,062.50$         1,549.62$       7,748.10$         550.00$          2,750.00$         -$                -$                 

Installation of Stage site (Vertical)  - Refer to Diagram B, D and E; Section II, pp. 15-20 2 EACH 30 -$                -$                 875.00$          1,750.00$         1,347.50$       2,695.00$         550.00$          1,100.00$         -$                -$                 

Installation of Stage + Rain Gauge site (Horizontal) - Refer to Diagram A, E and F; Section II, pp. 15-20 16 EACH 31 -$                -$                 1,125.00$       18,000.00$       1,707.75$       27,324.00$       5,750.00$       92,000.00$       -$                -$                 

Installation of Stage + Rain Gauge site (Vertical-Horizontal)  - Refer to Diagram A, C and E; Section II, 

pp. 15-20 0 EACH 32 -$                -$                 1,187.50$       -$                 2,118.88$       -$                 575.00$          -$                 -$                -$                 

Installation of Stage + Rain Gauge site (Vertical) - Refer to Diagram A, D and E; Section II, pp.15-20 2 EACH 33 -$                -$                 1,187.50$       2,375.00$         1,549.62$       3,099.24$         575.00$          1,150.00$         -$                -$                 

NO BID 92,125.00$       141,497.09$     64,675.00$       NO BID

Routine maintenance of Stage site - Refer to Section  II, pp. 21-26 50 EACH 34 110.00$          5,500.00$         624.00$          31,200.00$       93.50$            4,675.00$         720.00$          36,000.00$       205.00$          10,250.00$       

Routine maintenance of Stage + Rain Gauge site - Refer to Section H, pp. 21-26 22 EACH 35 120.00$          2,640.00$         744.00$          16,368.00$       130.62$          2,873.64$         960.00$          21,120.00$       225.00$          4,950.00$         

Rain Gauge Calibration (performed annually) - Refer to Exhibit H 22 EACH 36 50.00$            1,100.00$         528.00$          11,616.00$       260.70$          5,735.40$         240.00$          5,280.00$         85.00$            1,870.00$         

9,240.00$         59,184.00$       13,284.04$       62,400.00$       17,070.00$       

SECTION 7 - FUTURE POSSIBLE MAINTENANCE

SECTION 4

SECTION 6 - INSTALLATION SERVICE

SECTION 5 - INSTALLATION PARTS

SUBTOTAL SECTION 5
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SUBTOTAL SECTION 7

SUBTOTAL SECTION 4
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ANALYTICAL & 

DIAGNOSTIC SERVICES, 

LLC

LOCHER 

ENVIRONMENTAL 

TECHNOLOGY

Winter Haven, FL Venice, FL 

HYDROGAGE, INC. YSI, INC.

DNK ENVIRONMENTAL, 

INC. 

Vendor's City & State: Valrico, FL St. Petersburg, FL Lithia, FL 

SECTION 1 GRAND TOTAL 9,240.00$         549,336.66$     221,008.61$     451,431.30$     17,070.00$       
Extra Work: The Following activities are to be initiated upon written 

authorization.
HOURLY RATE TO PERFORM REPAIRS OR GENERAL SERVICES,

Straight Time Hourly Rate

Monday through Friday 7:00 a. m. to 5:00 p.m.

Foreman 25

PER 

HOUR 37 60.00$            1,500.00$         125.00$          3,125.00$         68.00$            1,700.00$         70.00$            1,750.00$         -$                -$                 

Helper 25
PER 

HOUR 38 30.00$            750.00$            55.00$            1,375.00$         42.50$            1,062.50$         70.00$            1,750.00$         -$                -$                 

Foreman 25

PER 

HOUR 39 60.00$            1,500.00$         125.00$          3,125.00$         68.00$            1,700.00$         105.00$          2,625.00$         -$                -$                 

Helper 25
PER 

HOUR 40 30.00$            750.00$            55.00$            1,375.00$         42.50$            1,062.50$         105.00$          2,625.00$         -$                -$                 

Foreman 
25

PER 

HOUR 41 60.00$            1,500.00$         125.00$          3,125.00$         90.00$            2,250.00$         105.00$          2,625.00$         -$                -$                 

Helper 
25

PER 

HOUR 42 30.00$            750.00$            55.00$            1,375.00$         63.75$            1,593.75$         105.00$          2,625.00$         -$                -$                 

When requested by the City shall be at Contractor's Actual Cost Plus ____________ 

(percent).                                                                                                                                  

Evidence of actual costs may be required through submittal of actual invoices. The unit price in the 

next column is 100% plus the mark­up.  For example: if mark­up is 10%, the unit price would be 

100% + 10% and the last column would be $1,000.00 x 110% = $1,100.00 1 EACH 43 115% 2.15$              -$                 15% 1.15$             25% 1.25$             15% 1.15$             

TOTAL EXTRA WORK  $      6,752.15 13,500.00$       9,369.90$      14,001.25$       -$                1.15$             

Calculated Total 15,992.15$    562,836.66$     230,378.51$     465,432.55$     17,071.15$       

Vendor's Total -$                 562,835.49$     -$                 -$                                -      

Terms             -                        -                        -                        -            
Visa E-Payable NO NO NO YES YES

1%, 15 DAYS

HOURLY RATE TO PERFORM REPAIRS OR GENERAL SERVICES,

Sunday and Holiday Hourly Rate

 

HOURLY RATE TO PERFORM REPAIRS OR GENERAL SERVICES,

Overtime Hourly Rate

******Holidays are based off city observed holidays*****

MATERIALS SUPPLIED BY THE CONTRACTOR
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ANALYTICAL & 

DIAGNOSTIC SERVICES, 

LLC

LOCHER 

ENVIRONMENTAL 

TECHNOLOGY

Winter Haven, FL Venice, FL 

HYDROGAGE, INC. YSI, INC.

DNK ENVIRONMENTAL, 

INC. 

Vendor's City & State: Valrico, FL St. Petersburg, FL Lithia, FL 

SECTION 1Would you be willing to serve as a secondary supplier? YES YES YES             -            YES

Contract and Acceptance:Form: YES YES YES YES YES

Addendum No. One (1) Acknowledged: YES YES YES YES YES

Bidder's Questionnaire YES YES YES YES YES

References and Project Information YES YES YES YES YES

MBE/VBE Certification:

   Expiration Date:     -        -        -        -        -    

Conflict of Interest Disclosure Form: YES YES YES YES YES

Certification Regarding Prohibition Against Contracting with Scruitinized Companies YES YES YES YES YES

Subcontractor Usage YES YES NO YES NO

Contractor' Personnel Listing: YES YES YES YES YEE

Site Investigation Affidavit: YES YES YES YES YES

Bidder's Certification: YES YES YES YES YES

Original and Copies

1 Original/1 copy/                  

Electronic Copy

1 Original/1 copy/                  

Electronic Copy

N/A

1 Original/1 copy/                  

Electronic Copy

1 Original/1 copy/                  

Electronic Copy

1 Original/1 copy/                  

Electronic Copy

N/A N/AN/AN/A
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