Staff Assistant: CITY OF ORLANDO Purchasing Agent:
E. Rodriguez Procurement and Contracts Division Lee Donate
BID TABULATION
IFB17-0047
SUBLET VEHICLE REPAIR
November 23, 2016 at 2:00 PM

Stewart & Stevenson FDDA
. . Central Truck & Rush Truck Center of FL
LLC, d/b/a Florida Detroit Greenway Ford Inc. . . C & H Garage Inc.
. . Equipment Repair, Inc. Inc.
Diesel Allison
Vendor's City & State: Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL
Description Unit Quant. Item | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
PART ONE (1): (GM, Light Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for General Motors (GM)
vehicles YR $100,000.00 1 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 2 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 3 (s - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Items 1 to 3:
WPART TWO (2): (Ford, Light Duty)
PARTS: Original Equpment Manufacturer (OEM) for Ford vehicles. YR $100,000.00 4 0% NO BID 18% $ 118,000.00 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 2.5% $ 102,500.00
PARTS: Aftermarket with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 5 0% NO BID 18% $ 47,200.00 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 15% $  46,000.00
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 6 || $ - NO BID $ 8295( $ 6221250 $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ 80.00f $ 60,000.00
Subtotal Items 4 to 6: $ 227,412.50 $ 208,500.00
WPART THREE (3): (Chrysler, Light Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Chrysler vehicles. YR $100,000.00 7 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 8 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 9 (I'$ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Items 7 to 9:
WPART FOUR (4): (Toyota, Light Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Toyota vehicles YR $100,000.00 10 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 11 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 12 || $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Iltems 10 to 12:
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Staff Assistant: CITY OF ORLANDO Purchasing Agent:
E. Rodriguez Procurement and Contracts Division Lee Donate
BID TABULATION
IFB17-0047
SUBLET VEHICLE REPAIR
November 23, 2016 at 2:00 PM

Stewart & Stevenson FDDA
. . Central Truck & Rush Truck Center of FL
LLC, d/b/a Florida Detroit Greenway Ford Inc. . . C & H Garage Inc.
. . Equipment Repair, Inc. Inc.
Diesel Allison
Vendor's City & State: Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL
Description Unit Quant. Item | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

PART FIVE (5): (Independent, Light Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for all vehicles. YR $100,000.00 13 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 10% $ 110,000.00 24% $ 124,000.00 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 14 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 10% $  44,000.00 34% $ 53,600.00 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 15 1% - NO BID $ - NO BID $ 10500 $ 78,750.00||$ 84.00| $ 63,000.00 |f $ - NO BID

Subtotal Items 13 to 15: $ 232,750.00 $ 240,600.00
PART SIX (6): (GM, Medium Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for GM vehicles YR $20,000.00 16 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $5,000.00 17 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 250 18 || $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID

Subtotal Items 16 to 18:
PART SEVEN (7): (Ford, Medium Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Ford vehicles. YR $100,000.00 19 0% NO BID 18% $ 118,000.00 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 10% $ 110,000.00
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 20 0% NO BID 18% $ 47,200.00 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 15% $ 46,000.00
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 21 || $ - NO BID $ 8295\ $ 6221250 $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ 80.00f $ 60,000.00

Subtotal Items 19 to 21: $ 227,412.50 $ 216,000.00
PART EIGHT (8): (Chrysler, Medium Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Chrysler vehicles. YR $100,000.00 22 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 23 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 24 |[$ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID

Subtotal Items 22 to 24:
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CITY OF ORLANDO
Procurement and Contracts Division
BID TABULATION
IFB17-0047
SUBLET VEHICLE REPAIR
November 23, 2016 at 2:00 PM

Staff Assistant:
E. Rodriguez

Purchasing Agent:
Lee Donate

Stewart & Stevenson FDDA
. . Central Truck & Rush Truck Center of FL
LLC, d/b/a Florida Detroit Greenway Ford Inc. . . C & H Garage Inc.
. . Equipment Repair, Inc. Inc.
Diesel Allison
Vendor's City & State: Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL
Description Unit Quant. Item | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

PART NINE (9): (Independent, Medium Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for all vehicles. YR $100,000.00 25 22% $ 122,000.00 0% NO BID 10% $ 110,000.00 0% NO BID 15% $ 115,000.00
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 26 22% $ 48,800.00 0% NO BID 10% $  44,000.00 0% NO BID 15% $ 46,000.00
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 27 |$ 8200 $ 61,500.00 || $ - NO BID $ 105.00( $ 78,750.00 | $ - NO BID $ 80.00|| $ 60,000.00

Subtotal Items 25 to 27: $ 232,300.00 $ 232,750.00 $ 221,000.00
PART TEN (10): (Peterbilt, Medium & Heavy Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Peterbilt vehicles. YR $100,000.00 28 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 30% $ 130,000.00
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 29 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 20% $ 48,000.00
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 30 [[$ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ 80.00|[ $ 60,000.00

Subtotal Items 28 to 30: $ 238,000.00
PART ELEVEN (11): (International, Medium & Heavy Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for International vehicles YR $100,000.00 31 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 32 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 33 [$ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID

Subtotal Items 31 to 33:
PART TWELVE (12): (Autocar, Medium & Heavy Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for vehicles. YR $100,000.00 34 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 35 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 36 || $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID

Subtotal Items 34 to 36:
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Staff Assistant:
E. Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO
Procurement and Contracts Division
BID TABULATION
IFB17-0047
SUBLET VEHICLE REPAIR
November 23, 2016 at 2:00 PM

Purchasing Agent:
Lee Donate

Stewart & Stevenson FDDA
. . Central Truck & Rush Truck Center of FL
LLC, d/b/a Florida Detroit Greenway Ford Inc. ) . C & H Garage Inc.
. . Equipment Repair, Inc. Inc.
Diesel Allison
Vendor's City & State: Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL
Description Unit Quant. Item | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
PART THIRTEEN (13): (Freightliner, Medium & Heavy Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Freightliner vehicles. YR $100,000.00 37 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 38 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 39 (| $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Items 37 to 39:
WPART FOURTEEN (14): (Independent, Heavy Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for all vehicles. YR $100,000.00 40 22% $ 122,000.00 0% NO BID 10% $ 110,000.00 0% NO BID 30% $ 130,000.00
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 41 22% $ 48,800.00 0% NO BID 10% $  44,000.00 0% NO BID 20% $  48,000.00
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 42 |[$ 8200 $ 61,500.00 || $ - NO BID $ 105.00 $ 78,750.00 || $ - NO BID $ 80.00[| $ 60,000.00
Subtotal Items 40 to 42: $ 232,300.00 $ 232,750.00 $ 238,000.00
Calculated Total: $ 464,600.00 $ 454,825.00 $ 698,250.00 $ 240,600.00 $1,121,500.00
Vendor's Total: $ 464,600.00 $ 454,825.00 $ 698,250.00 $ 240,600.00 $1,121,500.00
Discount Payment Terms: 0%/10 days - - - -
Visa ePayable? (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Secondary Supplier? (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bidders Certification Signed & Notarized: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contract & Acceptance for Solicitation: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bidder's Questionnaire Attached: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Conflit of Interest Disclosure Form Included: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
VBM Certification:
M/WBE Certification:
Expiration Date:
Original, Number of Copies & CD/Flash Drive: ‘ 1 Original, 2 Copies & Flash Drive 1 Original, 1 Copy & CD 1 Original, 1 Copy & CD 1 Original, 1 Copy & Flash Drive| 1 Original, 1 Copy & Flash Drive
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Staff Assistant:
E. Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO
Procurement and Contracts Division
BID TABULATION

IFB17-0047

SUBLET VEHICLE REPAIR
November 23, 2016 at 2:00 PM

Sun State Ford

Greenway Dodge

Kenworth of Central

Chrysler Jeep Florida
Vendor's City & State: Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL
Description Unit Quant. Item | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
PART ONE (1): (GM, Light Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for General Motors (GM)
vehicles YR $100,000.00 1 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 2 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 3 $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Items 1 to 3
PART TWO (2): (Ford, Light Duty)
PARTS: Original Equpment Manufacturer (OEM) for Ford vehicles. YR $100,000.00 4 10% $ 110,000.00 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 5 10% $ 44,000.00 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 6 ||$ 89.95( $ 67,462.50| $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal ltems 4 to 6: $ 221,462.50
PART THREE (3): (Chrysler, Light Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Chrysler vehicles. YR $100,000.00 7 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 8 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 9 || $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Items 7 to 9:
PART FOUR (4): (Toyota, Light Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Toyota vehicles YR $100,000.00 10 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 11 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 12 || $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Items 10 to 12:
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Purchasing Agent:
Lee Donate

NOTE: BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY. BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION.



Staff Assistant:
E. Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO
Procurement and Contracts Division
BID TABULATION
IFB17-0047
SUBLET VEHICLE REPAIR
November 23, 2016 at 2:00 PM

Greenway Dodge Kenworth of Central
Sun State Ford Y g .
Chrysler Jeep Florida
Vendor's City & State: Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL
Description Unit Quant. Item | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
PART FIVE (5): (Independent, Light Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for all vehicles. YR $100,000.00 13 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 14 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 15 || $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Items 13 to 15:
PART SIX (6): (GM, Medium Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for GM vehicles YR $20,000.00 16 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $5,000.00 17 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 250 18 || $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Items 16 to 18:
PART SEVEN (7): (Ford, Medium Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Ford vehicles. YR $100,000.00 19 10% $ 110,000.00 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 20 10% $ 44,000.00 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 21 [[$ 89.95||$ 67,46250( $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Items 19 to 21: $ 221,462.50
PART EIGHT (8): (Chrysler, Medium Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Chrysler vehicles. YR $100,000.00 22 0% NO BID 18% $ 118,000.00 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 23 0% NO BID 18% $ 47,200.00 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 24 || $ - NO BID $ 107.00| $ 80,250.00( $ - NO BID
| Subtotal ltems 22 to 24: $ 245,450.00
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Purchasing Agent:

Lee Donate

NOTE: BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY. BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION.



Staff Assistant:
E. Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO
Procurement and Contracts Division
BID TABULATION
IFB17-0047
SUBLET VEHICLE REPAIR
November 23, 2016 at 2:00 PM

Greenway Dodge Kenworth of Central
Sun State Ford Y g .
Chrysler Jeep Florida
Vendor's City & State: Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL
Description Unit Quant. Item | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
PART NINE (9): (Independent, Medium Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for all vehicles. YR $100,000.00 25 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 24% $ 124,000.00
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 26 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 24% $ 49,600.00
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 27 |[ $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ 100.00| $ 75,000.00
Subtotal Items 25 to 27: $ 248,600.00
PART TEN (10): (Peterbilt, Medium & Heavy Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Peterbilt vehicles. YR $100,000.00 28 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 29 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 30 || $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Items 28 to 30:
PART ELEVEN (11): (International, Medium & Heavy Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for International vehicles YR $100,000.00 31 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 32 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 33 (| $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID
Subtotal Items 31 to 33:
PART TWELVE (12): (Autocar, Medium & Heavy Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for vehicles. YR $100,000.00 34 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 24% $ 124,000.00
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 35 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 24% $ 49,600.00
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 36 || $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ 100.00} $ 75,000.00
| Subtotal ltems 34 to 36: $ 248,600.00
PAGE 7 OF 8

Purchasing Agent:

Lee Donate

NOTE: BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY. BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION.



Staff Assistant:
E. Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO
Procurement and Contracts Division
BID TABULATION
IFB17-0047
SUBLET VEHICLE REPAIR
November 23, 2016 at 2:00 PM

Sun State Ford

Greenway Dodge

Kenworth of Central

Chrysler Jeep Florida

Vendor's City & State: Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL

Description Unit Quant. Item | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
PART THIRTEEN (13): (Freightliner, Medium & Heavy Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for Freightliner vehicles. YR $100,000.00 37 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
|PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 38 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 0% NO BID
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 399 - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID

Subtotal Items 37 to 39:
PART FOURTEEN (14): (Independent, Heavy Duty)
PARTS: Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) for all vehicles. YR $100,000.00 40 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 24% $ 124,000.00
PARTS: Aftermarket, with prior approval of Fleet Management YR $40,000.00 41 0% NO BID 0% NO BID 24% $ 49,600.00
LABOR: Fixed hourly rate for labor HRS 750 42 ['$ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ 100.00 [ $ 75,000.00
Subtotal Items 40 to 42: $ 248,600.00
Calculated Total: $ 442,925.00 $ 245,450.00 $ 745,800.00
Vendor's Total: $ 442,925.00 $ 245,450.00 $ 745,800.00
Discount Payment Terms: 0%/30 days -
Visa ePayable? (Yes/No) Yes Yes
Secondary Supplier? (Yes/No) Yes Yes
Bidders Certification Signed & Notarized: Yes Yes Yes
Contract & Acceptance for Solicitation: Yes Yes Yes
Bidder's Questionnaire Attached: Yes Yes Yes
Conflit of Interest Disclosure Form Included: Yes Yes Yes
VBM Certification:
M/WBE Certification: 20074852
Expiration Date: 5/31/2016

Original, Number of Copies & CD/Flash Drive:

’ 1 Original, 1 Copy & Flash Drive

1 Original, 1 Copy & Flash Drive

1 Original, 1 Copy & Flash Drive
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Purchasing Agent:
Lee Donate

NOTE: BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY. BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION.
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