D. IFB-EC-13-248						
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5%, AA						
3 2:30PM						
			ALLIED UNIVERSAL CORPORATION	ODYSSEY MANUFACTURING COMPANY	AQUASOL COMMERCIAL CHEMICAL INC. DBA POOLSURE	THE DUMONT COMPANY
DESCRIPTION	<b>EST GALLONS</b>		MIAMI, FL	TAMPA, FL	HOUSTON, TX	OVIEDO, FL
LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION BULK SUPPLY BY TRUCK LOAD OF 2,000 GALLON OR MORE	1,407,000	COST (GAL)	\$0.484	\$0.545	N/A	NO BID
		TOTAL	\$680,988.00	\$766,815.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
SMALL SITE WATER, WASTEWATER, & LIFT STATION DELIVERIES OF LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION OF DELIVERIES OF LESS THAN 2,000 GALLONS	12,800	COST (GAL)	NO BID	N/A	\$1.05	\$1.24
		TOTAL	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$13,440.00	\$15,872.00
	DI		1.2	2	1	2
3	DESCRIPTION  LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION BULK SUPPLY BY TRUCK LOAD OF 2,000 GALLON OR MORE  SMALL SITE WATER, WASTEWATER, & LIFT STATION DELIVERIES OF LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION OF	DESCRIPTION  LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION BULK SUPPLY BY TRUCK LOAD OF 2,000 GALLON OR MORE  SMALL SITE WATER, WASTEWATER, & LIFT STATION DELIVERIES OF LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION OF DELIVERIES OF LESS THAN 2,000 GALLONS	DESCRIPTION  LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION BULK SUPPLY BY TRUCK LOAD OF 2,000 GALLON OR MORE  SMALL SITE WATER, WASTEWATER, & LIFT STATION DELIVERIES OF LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION OF DELIVERIES OF LESS THAN 2,000 GALLONS  TOTAL  TOTAL	3 2:30PM  DESCRIPTION EST GALLONS MIAMI, FL  LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION BULK SUPPLY BY TRUCK LOAD OF 2,000 GALLON OR MORE  SMALL SITE WATER, WASTEWATER, & LIFT STATION DELIVERIES OF LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION OF DELIVERIES OF LESS THAN 2,000 GALLONS  ALLIED UNIVERSAL CORT (GAL)  1,407,000  COST (GAL)  12,800  COST (GAL)  NO BID	3 2:30PM  ALLIED UNIVERSAL CORPORATION  DESCRIPTION EST GALLONS MIAMI, FL  LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION BULK SUPPLY BY TRUCK LOAD OF 2,000 GALLON OR MORE  TOTAL  SMALL SITE WATER, WASTEWATER, & LIFT STATION DELIVERIES OF LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION OF DELIVERIES OF LESS THAN 2,000 GALLONS  TOTAL  12,800  TOTAL  ALLIED UNIVERSAL COMPANY  TAMPA, FL  COST (GAL)  1,407,000 COST (GAL)  NO BID  N/A  TOTAL  \$0.00 \$0.00	B 2:30PM  ALLIED UNIVERSAL CORPORATION  DESCRIPTION  EST GALLONS  MIAMI, FL  TAMPA, FL  HOUSTON, TX  LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% SOLUTION BULK SUPPLY BY TRUCK LOAD OF 2,000 GALLON OR MORE  TOTAL  SMALL SITE WATER, WASTEWATER, & LIFT STATION DELIVERIES OF LIQUID SODIUM HYPOCHLONS  DELIVERIES OF LESS THAN 2,000 GALLONS  ALLIED UNIVERSAL CORPORATION  MIAMI, FL  TAMPA, FL  TOTAL  \$0.484  \$0.545  N/A  \$0.545  N/A  \$0.000  \$1.407,000  \$0.00  \$0.00  \$1.05  TOTAL  \$0.00  \$0.00  \$13,440.00