
Staff Assistant: 

Eli Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO

OFFICE OF PURCHASING

BID TABULATION

IFB15-0159

Janitorial Srvs for OPD, OFD Orlando Operations Center

February 26, 2015 at 2:00 pm

Purchasing Agent: 

Cindy Jordan

Description Unit Quantity Item Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

OPD Headquarters
MO 12 1

4,587.50$       55,050.00$     10,400.00$     124,800.00$                 9,039.87$       108,478.44$   6,540.00$          78,480.00$         8,554.78$       102,657.36$        

OPD Northwest Comm. Police Office MO 12 2
74.00$            888.00$          625.00$          7,500.00$                     617.59$          7,411.08$       402.00$             4,824.00$           129.58$          1,554.96$           

OPD Southeast Comm. Police Office MO 12 3
85.75$            1,029.00$       725.00$          8,700.00$                     623.81$          7,485.72$       732.00$             8,784.00$           280.97$          3,371.64$           

OPD Southwest Comm. Police Office MO 12 4
74.00$            888.00$          625.00$          7,500.00$                     592.93$          7,115.16$       390.00$             4,680.00$           100.39$          1,204.68$           

OPD Lake Nona Comm. Police Office MO 12 5
74.00$            888.00$          350.00$          4,200.00$                     362.76$          4,353.12$       227.50$             2,730.00$           42.72$            512.64$              

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-Ivey 

Lane
MO 12 6

74.00$            888.00$          625.00$          7,500.00$                     585.10$          7,021.20$       365.00$             4,380.00$           105.91$          1,270.92$           

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-

Murchison Terrace
MO 12 7

74.00$            888.00$          625.00$          7,500.00$                     311.81$          3,741.72$       365.00$             4,380.00$           59.18$            710.16$              

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office - 

Parramore
MO 12 8

74.00$            888.00$          625.00$          7,500.00$                     309.38$          3,712.56$       272.50$             3,270.00$           34.26$            411.12$              

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-Lake 

Mann Homes
MO 12 9

74.00$            888.00$          625.00$          7,500.00$                     306.00$          3,672.00$       197.50$             2,370.00$           57.00$            684.00$              

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-Reeves 

Terrace
MO 12 10

74.00$            888.00$          625.00$          7,500.00$                     307.07$          3,684.84$       180.00$             2,160.00$           51.39$            616.68$              

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-I-Drive 

Office
MO 12 11

74.00$            888.00$          475.00$          5,700.00$                     399.20$          4,790.40$       405.00$             4,860.00$           112.14$          1,345.68$           

OPD Downtown Patrol Office MO 12 12
74.00$            888.00$          350.00$          4,200.00$                     225.53$          2,706.36$       237.50$             2,850.00$           41.43$            497.16$              

Drug Enforcement Division MO 12 13
85.75$            1,029.00$       870.00$          10,440.00$                   904.90$          10,858.80$     685.00$             8,220.00$           43.61$            523.32$              

OPD Mounted Patrol Barn Office & 

Restrooms
MO 12 14

74.00$            888.00$          225.00$          2,700.00$                     79.10$            949.20$          147.00$             1,764.00$           3.41$             40.92$                

OPD Training Facility MO 12 15
85.75$            1,029.00$       1,400.00$       16,800.00$                   1,080.78$       12,969.36$     860.00$             10,320.00$         953.19$          11,438.28$         

OPD Training Facility Gun Range #1 MO 12 16
85.75$            1,029.00$       1,040.00$       12,480.00$                   56.88$            682.56$          172.00$             2,064.00$           20.00$            240.00$              

All N Professional 

Services, Inc.

Millennium Commercial Cleaning 

Services, Inc.

United States Service\ 

Industries, Inc. (USSI)

Cleaning Management 

Solutions of America, Inc.

Vendor's City & State: Miami, FL Tampa, FL Bethesda, MD Lakeland, FL Maitland, FL

Building Maintenance 

Services, Inc.

 NOTE:  BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY.  BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION. 1



Staff Assistant: 

Eli Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO

OFFICE OF PURCHASING

BID TABULATION

IFB15-0159

Janitorial Srvs for OPD, OFD Orlando Operations Center

February 26, 2015 at 2:00 pm

Purchasing Agent: 

Cindy Jordan

Description Unit Quantity Item Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

All N Professional 

Services, Inc.

Millennium Commercial Cleaning 

Services, Inc.

United States Service\ 

Industries, Inc. (USSI)

Cleaning Management 

Solutions of America, Inc.

Vendor's City & State: Miami, FL Tampa, FL Bethesda, MD Lakeland, FL Maitland, FL

Building Maintenance 

Services, Inc.

OPD Training Facility Gun Range #2 MO 12 17
85.75$            1,029.00$       1,215.00$       14,580.00$                   56.88$            682.56$          215.00$             2,580.00$           40.00$            480.00$              

OPD Training Facility Gun Range #3 MO 12 18
85.75$            1,029.00$       2,425.00$       29,100.00$                   56.88$            682.56$          430.00$             5,160.00$           70.00$            840.00$              

Orlando Operations Center plus Day 

Porter
MO 12 19

2,500.00$       30,000.00$     4,160.00$       49,920.00$                   2,505.86$       30,070.32$     1,295.00$          15,540.00$         1,623.36$       19,480.32$         

Primrose Center MO 12 20
3,667.00$       44,004.00$     4,160.00$       49,920.00$                   2,418.37$       29,020.44$     1,480.00$          17,760.00$         2,787.90$       33,454.80$         

Fire Station No. 1 MO 12 21
2,750.00$       33,000.00$     2,950.00$       35,400.00$                   2,315.35$       27,784.20$     1,167.00$          14,004.00$         912.69$          10,952.28$         

Asset Management/City Stores MO 12 22
85.75$            1,029.00$       275.00$          3,300.00$                     79.10$            949.20$          207.50$             2,490.00$           50.00$            600.00$              

Orlando Operations Center (detail 

dusting of 911 Call Center Pods)
MO 12 23

1,200.00$       14,400.00$     1,760.00$       21,120.00$                   27.00$            324.00$          100.00$             1,200.00$           25.00$            300.00$              

Orlando Operations Center (light rail 

dusting of 911 Call Center, Emergency 

Operations Center & Warning Point 

Office)

MO 12 24

267.00$          3,204.00$       1,760.00$       21,120.00$                   27.00$            324.00$          100.00$             1,200.00$           25.00$            300.00$              

Orlando Operations Center (detail 

dusting of Emergency Operations Center, 

Warning Point Office)

MO 12 25
1,200.00$       14,400.00$     1,760.00$       21,120.00$                   27.00$            324.00$          100.00$             1,200.00$           25.00$            300.00$              

Additional carpet shampooing SqFt 500 26
6.00$              3,000.00$       0.08$              40.00$                          0.15$              75.00$            0.25$                 125.00$              0.10$             50.00$                

Calculated Total:                                 214,029.00$   488,140.00$                 279,868.80$   207,395.00$       193,836.92$        

Vendor's Total: 211,029.00$   430,020.00$                 279,868.96$   197,395.00$       193,836.92$        

Discount Payment Terms:

Visa ePayable? (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes Yes No

Secondary Supplier? (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Addendum No. One Acknowledged: Yes Yes Yes No Yes

Addendum No. Two Acknowledged: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting Attendance:  (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Contract & Acceptance for Solicitation: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bidder's Questionnaire Attached: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

VBM Certification:

20145463 GF675977

03/31/2015 11/30/2015

Original & Number of Copies:

1.5%-10 Days

Bidders Certification Signed & Notarized:

M/WBE Certification:

       Expiration Date:

1 Original & 1 Copy 1 Original 1 Original & 1 Copy 1 Original & 1 Copy 1 Original & 1 Copy

 NOTE:  BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY.  BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION. 2



Staff Assistant: 

Eli Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO

OFFICE OF PURCHASING

BID TABULATION

IFB15-0159

Janitorial Srvs for OPD, OFD Orlando Operations Center

February 26, 2015 at 2:00 pm

Purchasing Agent: 

Cindy Jordan

Description Unit Quantity Item

OPD Headquarters
MO 12 1

OPD Northwest Comm. Police Office MO 12 2

OPD Southeast Comm. Police Office MO 12 3

OPD Southwest Comm. Police Office MO 12 4

OPD Lake Nona Comm. Police Office MO 12 5

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-Ivey 

Lane
MO 12 6

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-

Murchison Terrace
MO 12 7

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office - 

Parramore
MO 12 8

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-Lake 

Mann Homes
MO 12 9

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-Reeves 

Terrace
MO 12 10

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-I-Drive 

Office
MO 12 11

OPD Downtown Patrol Office MO 12 12

Drug Enforcement Division MO 12 13

OPD Mounted Patrol Barn Office & 

Restrooms
MO 12 14

OPD Training Facility MO 12 15

OPD Training Facility Gun Range #1 MO 12 16

Vendor's City & State:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

6,828.00$     81,936.00$         13,916.00$      166,992.00$     7,128.61$       85,543.32$         11,280.33$           135,363.96$    6,096.01$   73,152.12$        400.00$      4,800.00$        

350.00$        4,200.00$           951.00$           11,412.00$       149.06$          1,788.72$           228.42$               2,741.04$        211.87$      2,542.44$          400.00$      4,800.00$        

386.00$        4,632.00$           1,312.00$        15,744.00$       323.22$          3,878.64$           468.26$               5,619.12$        388.86$      4,666.32$          800.00$      9,600.00$        

354.00$        4,248.00$           1,193.00$        14,316.00$       202.10$          2,425.20$           301.10$               3,613.20$        246.58$      2,958.96$          400.00$      4,800.00$        

220.00$        2,640.00$           899.00$           10,788.00$       53.24$            638.88$             101.61$               1,219.32$        238.26$      2,859.12$          400.00$      4,800.00$        

323.00$        3,876.00$           1,009.00$        12,108.00$       121.83$          1,461.96$           176.50$               2,118.00$        214.09$      2,569.08$          400.00$      4,800.00$        

168.00$        2,016.00$           536.00$           6,432.00$         68.08$            816.96$             98.68$                 1,184.16$        169.32$      2,031.84$          360.00$      4,320.00$        

166.00$        1,992.00$           395.00$           4,740.00$         39.41$            472.92$             62.30$                 747.60$          109.41$      1,312.92$          360.00$      4,320.00$        

168.00$        2,016.00$           586.00$           7,032.00$         65.58$            786.96$             95.00$                 1,140.00$        123.63$      1,483.56$          400.00$      4,800.00$        

168.00$        2,016.00$           575.00$           6,900.00$         59.13$            709.56$             85.66$                 1,027.92$        275.70$      3,308.40$          360.00$      4,320.00$        

278.00$        3,336.00$           815.00$           9,780.00$         139.12$          1,669.44$           265.54$               3,186.48$        282.45$      3,389.40$          800.00$      9,600.00$        

220.00$        2,640.00$           724.00$           8,688.00$         83.46$            1,001.52$           98.65$                 1,183.80$        133.34$      1,600.08$          400.00$      4,800.00$        

525.00$        6,300.00$           1,304.00$        15,648.00$       501.67$          6,020.04$           726.80$               8,721.60$        461.72$      5,540.64$          723.00$      8,676.00$        

64.00$          768.00$             593.00$           7,116.00$         20.64$            247.68$             18.87$                 226.44$          82.18$        986.16$             360.00$      4,320.00$        

871.00$        10,452.00$         2,964.00$        35,568.00$       1,096.50$       13,158.00$         1,588.58$            19,062.96$      1,151.45$   13,817.40$        600.00$      7,200.00$        

278.00$        3,336.00$           1,024.00$        12,288.00$       774.00$          9,288.00$           1,121.35$            13,456.20$      532.97$      6,395.64$          918.00$      11,016.00$      

Suwanee, GA Mableton, GAOrlando, Inc. Oviedo, FLOrlando, FL Orlando, FL

Owens, Renz & Lee Donate 

Co., Inc. d/b/a Owens Realty 

Services

GMI Group, Inc. Tribond, LLC
KeeClean Manangement, 

Inc.
US Metro Group, Inc

South East Business 

Services, Inc.

 NOTE:  BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY.  BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION. 3



Staff Assistant: 

Eli Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO

OFFICE OF PURCHASING

BID TABULATION

IFB15-0159

Janitorial Srvs for OPD, OFD Orlando Operations Center

February 26, 2015 at 2:00 pm

Purchasing Agent: 

Cindy Jordan

Description Unit Quantity Item

Vendor's City & State:

OPD Training Facility Gun Range #2 MO 12 17

OPD Training Facility Gun Range #3 MO 12 18

Orlando Operations Center plus Day 

Porter
MO 12 19

Primrose Center MO 12 20

Fire Station No. 1 MO 12 21

Asset Management/City Stores MO 12 22

Orlando Operations Center (detail 

dusting of 911 Call Center Pods)
MO 12 23

Orlando Operations Center (light rail 

dusting of 911 Call Center, Emergency 

Operations Center & Warning Point 

Office)

MO 12 24

Orlando Operations Center (detail 

dusting of Emergency Operations Center, 

Warning Point Office)

MO 12 25

Additional carpet shampooing SqFt 500 26

Calculated Total:                                 

Vendor's Total:

Discount Payment Terms:

Visa ePayable? (Yes/No)

Secondary Supplier? (Yes/No)

Addendum No. One Acknowledged:

Addendum No. Two Acknowledged:

Mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting Attendance:  (Yes/No)

Contract & Acceptance for Solicitation:

Bidder's Questionnaire Attached:

VBM Certification:

Original & Number of Copies:

Bidders Certification Signed & Notarized:

M/WBE Certification:

       Expiration Date:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Suwanee, GA Mableton, GAOrlando, Inc. Oviedo, FLOrlando, FL Orlando, FL

Owens, Renz & Lee Donate 

Co., Inc. d/b/a Owens Realty 

Services

GMI Group, Inc. Tribond, LLC
KeeClean Manangement, 

Inc.
US Metro Group, Inc

South East Business 

Services, Inc.

278.00$        3,336.00$           1,182.00$        14,184.00$       860.00$          10,320.00$         1,245.95$            14,951.40$      617.97$      7,415.64$          1,020.00$   12,240.00$      

530.00$        6,360.00$           1,642.00$        19,704.00$       1,720.00$       20,640.00$         2,491.89$            29,902.68$      1,009.66$   12,115.92$        1,500.00$   18,000.00$      

1,613.00$     19,356.00$         3,605.00$        43,260.00$       1,720.00$       20,640.00$         2,491.89$            29,902.68$      1,869.78$   22,437.36$        2,348.00$   28,176.00$      

2,336.00$     28,032.00$         5,981.00$        71,772.00$       3,794.19$       45,530.28$         4,065.52$            48,786.24$      2,258.72$   27,104.64$        2,484.00$   29,808.00$      

1,680.00$     20,160.00$         4,763.00$        57,156.00$       2,099.83$       25,197.96$         3,114.86$            37,378.32$      1,582.11$   18,985.32$        1,607.00$   19,284.00$      

82.00$          984.00$             937.00$           11,244.00$       74.52$            894.24$             199.84$               2,398.08$        174.02$      2,088.24$          590.00$      7,080.00$        

23.00$          276.00$             450.00$           5,400.00$         81.90$            982.80$             325.00$               3,900.00$        106.83$      1,281.96$          1,500.00$   18,000.00$      

23.00$          276.00$             325.00$           3,900.00$         81.90$            982.80$             325.00$               3,900.00$        100.75$      1,209.00$          600.00$      7,200.00$        

47.00$          564.00$             275.00$           3,300.00$         81.90$            982.80$             325.00$               3,900.00$        137.33$      1,647.96$          897.00$      10,764.00$      

0.10$            50.00$               0.11$               55.00$             0.25$             125.00$             0.21$                   105.00$          0.12$          60.00$               0.17$          85.00$             

215,798.00$       575,527.00$     256,203.68$       375,736.20$    222,960.12$      247,609.00$    

215,798.00$       594,861.00$     256,203.99$       375,735.52$    222,960.23$      247,609.00$    

No Yes No No No

Yes Yes No No Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

20161160 246265

11/30/2015 11/30/2015

1 Original & 1 Copy1 Original & 1 Copy1 Original & 1 Copy1 Original & 1 Copy1 Original & 1 Copy1 Original & 1 Copy

 NOTE:  BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY.  BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION. 4



Staff Assistant: 

Eli Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO

OFFICE OF PURCHASING

BID TABULATION

IFB15-0159

Janitorial Srvs for OPD, OFD Orlando Operations Center

February 26, 2015 at 2:00 pm

Purchasing Agent: 

Cindy Jordan

Description Unit Quantity Item

OPD Headquarters
MO 12 1

OPD Northwest Comm. Police Office MO 12 2

OPD Southeast Comm. Police Office MO 12 3

OPD Southwest Comm. Police Office MO 12 4

OPD Lake Nona Comm. Police Office MO 12 5

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-Ivey 

Lane
MO 12 6

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-

Murchison Terrace
MO 12 7

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office - 

Parramore
MO 12 8

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-Lake 

Mann Homes
MO 12 9

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-Reeves 

Terrace
MO 12 10

OPD Neighborhood Patrol Office-I-Drive 

Office
MO 12 11

OPD Downtown Patrol Office MO 12 12

Drug Enforcement Division MO 12 13

OPD Mounted Patrol Barn Office & 

Restrooms
MO 12 14

OPD Training Facility MO 12 15

OPD Training Facility Gun Range #1 MO 12 16

Vendor's City & State:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

6,183.00$   74,196.00$       No Bid 7,418.92$      89,027.04$     10,660.00$    127,920.00$   600.00$          7,200.00$       12,778.00$    153,336.00$  

274.80$      3,297.60$         No Bid 323.96$         3,887.52$       325.00$         3,900.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       561.00$         6,732.00$      

412.20$      4,946.40$         No Bid 504.42$         6,053.04$       650.00$         7,800.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       1,001.00$      12,012.00$    

274.80$      3,297.60$         No Bid 322.27$         3,867.24$       650.00$         7,800.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       707.00$         8,484.00$      

274.80$      3,297.60$         1,615.00$   19,380.00$          195.79$         2,349.48$       195.00$         2,340.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       328.00$         3,936.00$      

274.80$      3,297.60$         No Bid 164.14$         1,969.68$       325.00$         3,900.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       398.00$         4,776.00$      

233.58$      2,802.96$         No Bid 160.99$         1,931.88$       325.00$         3,900.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       360.00$         4,320.00$      

233.58$      2,802.96$         No Bid 156.04$         1,872.48$       325.00$         3,900.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       340.00$         4,080.00$      

219.84$      2,638.08$         1,900.00$   22,800.00$          160.61$         1,927.32$       325.00$         3,900.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       350.00$         4,200.00$      

219.84$      2,638.08$         No Bid 152.19$         1,826.28$       325.00$         3,900.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       354.00$         4,248.00$      

329.76$      3,957.12$         No Bid 214.13$         2,569.56$       390.00$         4,680.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       670.00$         8,040.00$      

274.80$      3,297.60$         No Bid 105.35$         1,264.20$       195.00$         2,340.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       340.00$         4,080.00$      

563.34$      6,760.08$         No Bid 425.39$         5,104.68$       650.00$         7,800.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       1,065.00$      12,780.00$    

233.58$      2,802.96$         610.00$      7,320.00$            33.32$           399.84$          110.00$         1,320.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       100.00$         1,200.00$      

1,319.04$   15,828.48$       2,295.00$   27,540.00$          1,136.37$      13,636.44$     1,950.00$      23,400.00$     620.00$          7,440.00$       1,475.00$      17,700.00$    

179.00$      2,148.00$         630.00$      7,560.00$            83.31$           999.72$          1,300.00$      15,600.00$     600.00$          7,200.00$       290.00$         3,480.00$      

Orlando, FL

Chi-Ada Corp
D&A Building Services, 

Inc.

XxtraOrdinary Services, 

Inc.

Empowered Nova Corp. 

d/b/a Elite Empire 

Maintenance Co.

Oakland Park, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Altamonte Springs, FL

Anago of Orlando
Make It Clean Solutions, 

LLC

 NOTE:  BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY.  BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION. 5



Staff Assistant: 

Eli Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO

OFFICE OF PURCHASING

BID TABULATION

IFB15-0159

Janitorial Srvs for OPD, OFD Orlando Operations Center

February 26, 2015 at 2:00 pm

Purchasing Agent: 

Cindy Jordan

Description Unit Quantity Item

Vendor's City & State:

OPD Training Facility Gun Range #2 MO 12 17

OPD Training Facility Gun Range #3 MO 12 18

Orlando Operations Center plus Day 

Porter
MO 12 19

Primrose Center MO 12 20

Fire Station No. 1 MO 12 21

Asset Management/City Stores MO 12 22

Orlando Operations Center (detail 

dusting of 911 Call Center Pods)
MO 12 23

Orlando Operations Center (light rail 

dusting of 911 Call Center, Emergency 

Operations Center & Warning Point 

Office)

MO 12 24

Orlando Operations Center (detail 

dusting of Emergency Operations Center, 

Warning Point Office)

MO 12 25

Additional carpet shampooing SqFt 500 26

Calculated Total:                                 

Vendor's Total:

Discount Payment Terms:

Visa ePayable? (Yes/No)

Secondary Supplier? (Yes/No)

Addendum No. One Acknowledged:

Addendum No. Two Acknowledged:

Mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting Attendance:  (Yes/No)

Contract & Acceptance for Solicitation:

Bidder's Questionnaire Attached:

VBM Certification:

Original & Number of Copies:

Bidders Certification Signed & Notarized:

M/WBE Certification:

       Expiration Date:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Orlando, FL

Chi-Ada Corp
D&A Building Services, 

Inc.

XxtraOrdinary Services, 

Inc.

Empowered Nova Corp. 

d/b/a Elite Empire 

Maintenance Co.

Oakland Park, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL Altamonte Springs, FL

Anago of Orlando
Make It Clean Solutions, 

LLC

179.00$      2,148.00$         720.00$      8,640.00$            83.31$           999.72$          1,625.00$      19,500.00$     600.00$          7,200.00$       375.00$         4,500.00$      

179.00$      2,148.00$         1,440.00$   17,280.00$          83.31$           999.72$          2,925.00$      35,100.00$     600.00$          7,200.00$       670.00$         8,040.00$      

3,160.20$   37,922.40$       3,529.00$   42,348.00$          1,539.53$      18,474.36$     2,925.00$      35,100.00$     600.00$          7,200.00$       3,560.00$      42,720.00$    

3,146.46$   37,757.52$       No Bid 1,890.81$      22,689.72$     4,875.00$      58,500.00$     600.00$          7,200.00$       3,925.00$      47,100.00$    

2,061.00$   24,732.00$       No Bid 1,706.79$      20,481.48$     4,225.00$      50,700.00$     600.00$          7,200.00$       2,345.00$      28,140.00$    

288.54$      3,462.48$         814.00$      9,768.00$            82.38$           988.56$          650.00$         7,800.00$       600.00$          7,200.00$       530.00$         6,360.00$      

252.00$      3,024.00$         125.00$      1,500.00$            100.00$         1,200.00$       60.00$           720.00$          600.00$          7,200.00$       50.00$           600.00$         

252.00$      3,024.00$         95.00$        1,140.00$            100.00$         1,200.00$       60.00$           720.00$          600.00$          7,200.00$       50.00$           600.00$         

400.00$      4,800.00$         225.00$      2,700.00$            100.00$         1,200.00$       30.00$           360.00$          600.00$          7,200.00$       50.00$           600.00$         

0.204$        102.00$            0.08$          40.00$                 0.08$             40.00$            0.25$             125.00$          0.35$             175.00$          0.12$             60.00$           

257,129.52$     168,016.00$        206,959.96$   433,025.00$   180,415.00$   392,124.00$  

257,130.24$     168,020.80$        203,319.96$   433,005.00$   180,175.00$   392,124.00$  

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

20773683

04/30/2015

1 Original 1 Original & 1 Copy 1 Original & 1 Copy 1 Original & 1 Copy 1 Original & 1 Copy1 Original & 1 Copy

 NOTE:  BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY.  BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION. 6


