
Staff Assistant: 
Eli Rodriguez

CITY OF ORLANDO / PROCUREMENT CONTRACTS DIVISION
BID TABULATION

IFB14-0218 - Hose, Tubing and Related Products
September 11, 2014 at 2:00 pm

Purchasing Agent: 
Lee Donate

Description Unit Quant. Item Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

ADAPTER, HOSE BRASS SWIVEL ¾ FGHTXFGHT  EA 50 1 3.79$          189.50$             No Bid 5.70$             285.00$                

TUBING, CLEAR VINYL #14 3/8” 100 FT/ROLL #14 RL 2500 2 0.24$          600.00$             No Bid 0.51$             1,275.00$             

NOZZLE,  BRASS HOSE ¾” X 6” EA 50 3 21.48$        1,074.00$          No Bid 11.15$           557.50$                

HOSE, SPIRALITE 320 ½” 560 PSI FT 1500 4 0.84$          1,260.00$          No Bid 1.26$             1,890.00$             

TUBING CLEAR VINYL #31 ¾” I.D. 100/FT/RL FT 3000 5 0.76$          2,280.00$          No Bid 0.86$             2,580.00$             

TUBING,  REINFORCED FOOD GD ¾ X 1  1/16” FT 1500 6 1.78$          2,670.00$          No Bid 1.33$             1,995.00$             

TUBING,  REINFORCED FOOD GD 1/2 X 50’ FT 1500 7 0.40$          600.00$             No Bid 0.77$             1,155.00$             

TUBING, AMACLEAR ½” I.D. #20 100/RL FT 3000 8 0.59$          1,770.00$          No Bid 0.64$             1,920.00$             

TUBING, AMACLEAR 1” I.D. #38, TRNT 38 FT 3000 9 0.22$          660.00$             No Bid 2.61$             7,830.00$             

BANDING, SS BAND-IT ½” X 100’ EA 10 10 0.58$          5.80$                 No Bid 68.44$           684.40$                

TUBING, FLEX POLY BLACK 3/8” OD 100/RL FT 3000 11 1.39$          4,170.00$          No Bid 0.20$             600.00$                

HOSE, GAS COMPRESSOR SEAL WATER EA 2 12 200.00$      400.00$             No Bid 47.91$           95.82$                  

TUBING, TYGON  ¼  I.D. 3/8 OD 1/16 W 50’ RL FT 3000 13 2.10$          6,300.00$          No Bid 0.17$             510.00$                

HOSE, ¾” I.D. RUBBER 250 PSI FT 3000 14 0.95$          2,850.00$          No Bid 1.60$             4,800.00$             

HOSE, 3/8” X 100’ W 3/8” FIT JO6 END EA 25 15 194.40$      4,860.00$          No Bid 176.65$         4,416.25$             

FITTING,  GALV 1” M NPT AIR KING EA 150 16 4.74$          711.00$             No Bid 4.62$             693.00$                

VALVE, DRAINCOCK BRASS MPT 1/8” EA 150 17 1.75$          262.50$             No Bid 6.95$             1,042.50$             

COUPLING, QUICK DISCON ¼” AIR MALE EA 150 18 1.06$ 159.00$ No Bid 1.21$ 181.50$

Northrock Enterprises, 
LLC Pirtek Orlando Amazon Hose & Rubber, 

Company

Vendor's City & State: Pembroke Pines, FL Orlando, FL Orlando, FL

COUPLING, QUICK DISCON ¼  AIR MALE EA 150 18 1.06$         159.00$            No Bid 1.21$            181.50$               

HOSE, AIR ½” I.D. MAXICON 300 PSI EA 5000 19 1.18$          5,900.00$          No Bid 1.61$             8,050.00$             

TUBING, POLYFLO 3/8 OD ¼ I.D. NATURAL EA 2500 20 1.20$          3,000.00$          No Bid 0.18$             450.00$                

GASKET, MAT. RED RUBBER 1/16” TX48”WX60” FT 100 21 17.16$        1,716.00$          No Bid 6.34$             634.00$                

COUPLING, QUICK DISCON ¼” AIR FEMALE FT 150 22 5.92$          888.00$             No Bid 6.81$             1,021.50$             

HOSE, AIR ¼ I.D. GOODYEAR 300 PSI FT 3500 23 0.45$          1,575.00$          No Bid 1.06$             3,710.00$             

GASKET, QUICK DISCON PT BLACK 4” EA 150 24 1.02$          153.00$             No Bid 1.53$             229.50$                

GASKET, QUICK DISCON PT BLACK 2” EA 150 25 0.60$          90.00$               No Bid 0.71$             106.50$                

GASKET, MATERIAL VEGETABLE FIBER EA 15 26 10.47$        157.05$             No Bid 2.67$             40.05$                  

FITTING, PT MALE ADPT/FEMALE THD 2” EA 150 27 2.80$          420.00$             No Bid 3.98$             597.00$                

FITTING, BRASS POLYLINE MALE  EA 150 28 7.90$          1,185.00$          No Bid 8.82$             1,323.00$             

FITTING, BRASS POLYLINE MALE CONNECTOR EA 150 29 6.85$          1,027.50$          No Bid 3.58$             537.00$                

FITTING, PT FEMALE CPLNG/MALE THREADD 1 EA 150 30 5.07$          760.50$             No Bid 8.39$             1,258.50$             

FITTING, PT MALE ADP/FEMALE THREADD 1 ½ EA 150 31 2.44$          366.00$             No Bid 3.26$             489.00$                

FITTING, PT MALE ADAPTER ¾ (POLY) EA 150 32 2.93$          439.50$             No Bid 4.25$             637.50$                

FITTING, HOSE BARB ¾ X ¾ MALE BRASS EA 150 33 6.96$          1,044.00$          No Bid 3.94$             591.00$                

TUBING, POLYFLOW FOOD GRADE 1” I.D. FT 3000 34 1.18$          3,540.00$          No Bid 2.00$             6,000.00$             

FITTING, PT FEMALE CPLNG/MALE THD 2” EA 250 35 6.07$          1,517.50$          No Bid 9.92$             2,480.00$             

FITTING, PT MALE ADAPTER/FEMALE THR ¾” EA 250 36 1.80$          450.00$             No Bid 2.55$             637.50$                

COUPLER, ‘D’ ¾ POLYPROPYLENE CAM LOCK EA 250 37 7.24$          1,810.00$          No Bid 8.99$             2,247.50$             

 NOTE:  BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY.  BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION.
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COUPLER, ‘B’ ¾ POLYPROPYLENE CAM LOCK, ¾, EA 250 38 7.24$          1,810.00$          No Bid 8.99$             2,247.50$             

TUBING, POLYWIRE ½” I.D. FT 5000 39 1.48$          7,400.00$          No Bid 2.13$             10,650.00$           

FITTING, HOSE BARB ½” MALE BRASS, ½ MALE EA 250 40 1.85$          462.50$             No Bid 2.86$             715.00$                

FITTING, HOSE BARB ½” I.D. X 3/8” NPT EA 250 41 1.20$          300.00$             No Bid 1.87$             467.50$                

GASKET, MATERIAL ¼” X 36” NEO DURO #60 FT 250 42 20.25$        5,062.50$          No Bid 15.77$           3,942.50$             

FITTING HOSE BARB BRASS ¼” 10/BX, ¼ MALE EA 250 43 0.78$          195.00$             No Bid 1.20$             300.00$                

HOSE, R-5-4 16”-104-804 ¼” EA 2 44 15.58$        31.16$               No Bid 28.03$           56.06$                  

TUBE, 5/8 POLYETHYLENE SAMPLER PICKUP RL 5000 45 3.06$          15,300.00$        No Bid 0.36$             1,800.00$             

SLEEVE, COMPRESSION  3/8 BRASS EA 150 46 0.42$          63.00$               No Bid 0.12$             18.00$                  

FITTING, BRASS ¼” ELBOW, 3500X4 WTH. HED EA 150 47 3.06$          459.00$             No Bid 2.73$             409.50$                

FITTING, PT MALE THRD ADAPTER/4” ALUM EA 150 48 10.20$        1,530.00$          No Bid 14.24$           2,136.00$             

FITTING BRASS ¼” TEE, 3700X4 WTH.HED EA 150 49 3.24$          486.00$             No Bid 2.72$             408.00$                

FITTING, BRASS ¼” X 2 NIPPLE , 3328X4 WTH.HED EA 150 50 2.32$          348.00$             No Bid 1.51$             226.50$                

COUPLER, 2” PVC FEMALE THREADED X FEMALE EA 250 51 11.61$        2,902.50$          No Bid 14.76$           3,690.00$             

COUPLER, 2” PVC 80 MALE THREADED X FEMALE EA 5 52 4.62$          23.10$               No Bid No Bid

FITTING, PT FEMALE COUP/MALE THR, 4”, PART B EA 250 53 13.79$        3,447.50$          No Bid 19.39$           4,847.50$             

NOZZLE, WATER, CHROME PLATED, PISTOL GRIP, EA 250 54 7.24$          1,810.00$          No Bid 5.72$             1,430.00$             

ADDITIONAL ITEMS:  MATERIAL YR 5,000.00$       55 120% 6,000.00$         No Bid No Bid,$ % ,$
Calculated Total:                                 104,491.11$         -$                         96,894.58$              
Vendor's Total: 104,093.40$         -$                         96,894.58$              
Discount Payment Terms:
Visa ePayable? (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes
Secondary Supplier? (Yes/No) Yes No Yes

Yes Yes Yes
Contract & Acceptance for Solicitation: Yes Yes Yes
Bidder's Questionnaire Attached: Yes Yes Yes
Veteran's Preference? (Yes/No) N/A N/A

N/A 2005119841

Original & Number of Copies:

Bidders Certification Signed & Notarized:

Minority Certification:
       Expiration Date: 2/10/2015

1 Original & 1 Copy 1 Original & 1 Copy 1 Original

 NOTE:  BID TABULATIONS ARE POSTED AS INFORMATION ONLY.  BID SUBMITTALS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION. A NOTICE OF INTENDED ACTION WILL BE ISSUED UPON FINAL EVALUATION.
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